-~

e § 754
PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE

QJ¥

pl’\ {\ E

~

Office: 903 693 0333

314 W. Wellington
Fax 903 693.9366

Carthage, Texas 75633

Sheriff Kevin Lake

September 10, 2015
HONORABLE COMMISSIONER’S COURT

Re: Food Bid

it is my recommendation the below listed companies be awarded contracts for food items for the
October 01, 2015 through March 31, 2016 period.

Performance Food Service
, Flowers Foods

Tyson Foods, Inc.

Respectfully,

Lt. Tina C. McMullen

Honesty, Integrity, Service
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Office: 903 693 0333

314 W. Wellington
Fax® 903 693.9366

Carthage, Texas 75633

Sheriff Kevin Lake

August 18, 2015

Performance Food Group
Attn: Jessie York

Attention: Mr. York

Re: Bids for Food Items

The Panola County Detention Center is taking bids for food items. The attached contains food items that would be
purchased during the next six months. Please note that the form is somewhat different. it is requested by the auditor’s
office that the item number, package size and type of good be listed and the bid list. | would appreciate a bid on any and
all items/products that you sell. If you do not sell any of the items listed, please fill in “not applicable” in the cost
column. All entries must be typed; electronic format is available upon request.

If you do not wish to submit a bid, please fax this letter back “No Bid Submitted” and your signature.

The items bid selected for purchase will be for a six month period, beginning October 1, 2015 through March 31, 2016.
It is understood that fresh produce, fresh meat products and fresh cheeses can only be predicted on a weekly basis.

The Panola County Commissioners Court request | have the bids in hand by September 4, 2015. You may return by mail,
email or hand deliver. Thank you in advance for your time and consideration.

Lt. Tina C. McMullen, Jail Administrator
Panola County Detention Center
tina.mcmullen@co.panola.tx.us

COMPANY NAME ?( oA

NO BID SUBMITTED

N =z
BID SUBMITTED/SEE ATTACHED&IV\C\,\\Q«(') /

Honesty, Integrity, Service
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County of Panola

110 S. Sycamore * Room 216-A
Carthage * Texas 75633
Phone 903-693-0391  Fax 903-693-2726

September 14, 2015

Mr. Jessie York
Performance Food Group

NOTIFICATION OF BID AWARD

County, Judge
.Lee Ann Jones

County Commissioners
Ronnie LaGrone, Pct #1
John Gradberg, Pct #2
Frank R Langley, Jr, Pct #3
Dale LaGrone, Pct #4

This is to notify you that your firm has been awarded a contract by the Panola
County Commissioners’ Court on September 14, 2015. The contract is for a period

beginning October 1, 2015 and ending March 31, 2016.

You have been awarded the bid for the following item(s) and/or service(s):

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS/SERVICES BID PRICE

Miscellaneous Food ltems/Products

(See Attached Bid) As Bid

,
ffw_ fé@%mﬂﬂ

COUNTY JUDGE

September 14, 2015

DATE



Food Bid Sheet

October 1, 2015 to March 31, 2016
Must use Excel Spreadsheet (Tvped) a
**Electronic File C r
Size Prod Description PRICE Pack/Size/Brand PFG ltem
Id Number
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Size Prod Description PRICE Pack/Size/Brand PFG item
id Number

160z Allspice Ground NO BID

125/Cnt Apple Del Red Fcy Fresh $20.96 1 113 CT WSHNGTN 23022
100 CT Apple Red Del Fresh $21.96 1 138 CT PACKER 942985
1CS Apple Sliced in Water Fancy $39.26 6#10 WESTCRK |228588
1CS Applesauce Splenda NSA $29.48 6#10 WESTCRK [228606
6/#10 Applesauce Swtn Fancy $26.11 6 #10 SLVR SRC 228630
48/CNT Avocado Hass Fresh $36.68 148 CT PACKER 932638
15/Lbs Bacon Si Slab 14-17 Siver Fz $49.13 115LB WESTCRK (339817
200/CNT Bag Plastic Freezer 1 Gal $25.52 1200 CT FRST MRK 425935
1/5Lb Baking Powder $10.99 15LB CLBR GRL 248020
24/160z Baking Soda $18.35 241LB MAJOR 938925
40/Lbs Banana Grn Tip 3 Fresh $17.63 140 LB PACKER 940844
10/LBS Banana i/w singles 24 count $6.79 110 LB DOLEFR 61265
4/1 Gal Barbecue Sauce $30.20 41GA SLVRSRC (234884
6/#10 Bean Baked Seas W/ Bac Brown Sugar $32.96 6 #10 ALLENS 33147
1CS Bean Baked Seas w/Bacon NO BID

6/#10 Bean Chili Mexican Style w/Pinto Beans $23.09 6#10 ALLENS 975269
1CS Bean Green Cut 4-5 Sieve $24.03 6#10 WEST CRK 863505
6H10 Bean Green Cut Short Fancy $22.98 6 #10 SLVR SRC 863501
610 Bean Lima Green Med Fancy $25.87 6#10 WESTCRK [863476
6/#10 Bean Pinto Fancy Brine $20.71 6#10 WEST CRK 862156
20/Lbs Bean Pinto Trpl Cind Box Dry $11.46 120 LB JCK RBT 334962
6/#10 Bean Pork & Beans Showboat $22.84 6#10 SHOWBOAT [55081
6/#10 Bean Refried Pinto W/lLard $25.60 6#10 ALLENS 33125
1/20 Ib Beans - Pinto - Dried $23.37 150 LB SLVRSRC 1262999
6410 Beans - ranch style $29.81 6#10 RNCH STY 80071
1/20 Ib Beans-Black-eyed peas - Dried $25.20 120 LB SLVR SRC {390428
160/Cnt Beef Finger Brd 97 Oz Fc Vpp R/F F/O/M Fz $29.62 160 0.97 OZ 69083

ADVANCE

8/10Avg Beef Gr Buk 80/20 Fine Tube Raw Ref $2.84 8 10#AV IBP 976609
1CS Beef Gr Pty 3-1 75/25 $30.14 30 5.33 OZ WEST CRK [158842
1CS Beef Gr Pty 4-1 78/22 Nat $54.45 6040Z CLOUD 44123
15/Lbs Beef Gr Pty 6 Oz 78/22 Nat Seas Scored Fz $54.45 45 5.33 OZ CLOUD 44107
3/30Cnt Beef Gr Pty Fc Vpp Fimbrl Avg 160/30z Oz Fz $58.94 90 2.5 OZ TNDRBROL [39361
8/10 LB Beef Ground BUK 81/19 136 Ref $2.78 8§ 10 LB WEST CRK 296565
15/LBS Beef Ground Pty 4-LAVG 78/22 $31.07 404 Q0Z WEST CRK [158849
404 0z Beef Patty $31.07 404 OZ WEST CRK |158849
100/1.6 Beef Pty 16-1 W/sty Stick $37.89 114 1.4 OZ ADVANCE|411354
160/3 OZ Beef Pty Salisbury Charb $93.60 1143 0Z ADVANCE (39371
100/3 OZ Beef Rib Pty Honey BBQ Fz $79.72 1003 0Z SMRTPCKS|347169
40/4 2 oz Beef Steak Fritter $26.81 404 0Z ADVANCE [50699
10/Lbs Beef Stew Meat DIx Fz $2.84 2 5LB AV PERFCM [331766
40/4 OZ Beef Stk C/Fried PRTR $35.56 404 OZ SPRCRSPY |[878161
10/Lbs Beef Stk C/Fried W/Sty Brd W/ Bikpep Raw $35.25 404 0Z BLUELAB [58525
6/5Lb Biscuit Buttermilk Mix $28.44 6 5LB MORRISON [941463
10/Lbs Bologna All Meat Stick Bronze Medal Label $30.40 110 LB FARMLAND }73046
10.5/Lbs Bread Garlic Toast Bkd SI Avg 120/1.4 Oz Fz $24.83 1125 CT HRTG OVN 291102




Size Prod Description PRICE Packi/Size/Brand PFG ltem
id Number
Food Bid Sheet
QQQMMmh 31 2016
**Electronlc -|Ie Can_Be_SgnLEmﬂm.ng_E_umg_sg_s if Reaue ted
Size Prod Description PRICE
id
16/8 CT PepFarm Bread Toast Garlic NO BID
1-20# Breaded Squash $23.13 45LB WESTCRK ]995204
30/Lbs Broccoli Cuts 1" Grd A Igf $17.76 120 LB SIMPLOT 181036
6/5Lb Brownie Mix $27.92 65LB HOSPTLTY {43125
72/40z Burrito Beef/Bean Red Chile Whte Flour Fz $31.47 72407 LITTLE] 980465
72130Z Burnto Brkfst 3 oz Ckd $48.89 90 3.50 OZ 373436
FERNANDO
90/350Z Frnando Burrito Brkfst Eggsausge Whigr $48.89 903.50 0Z 373436
FERNANDO

216/22 0Z Pillsby Dough Biscuit Sothrn E-Z Spl $40.58 216 2.2 OZ PILLSBRY 890190
25/LBS Biscuit Mix Complete $21.64 125LB TASTEMKR (943564
12/640:z Buttermilk Baking Ref $23.35 12.5GA COLEMANS 873812
50/Lbs Cabbage Grn Jbo Bag Fresh $19.51 150 LB PACKER 61296
50/LBS Cabbage Grn Med #1 Fressub $27.12 150 LB PACKER 61295
6/5 LB Cake Mix Asst Choc/White $29.46 651L.B HOSPTLTY {65701
6/5 LB Cake Mix Choc 2-Way NO BID
6/5 LB Cake Mix Dvifd Western $28.04 65LB GILSTER 65002
6/5Lb Cake Mix White $24.40 651LB GILSTER 988774
6/5 LB Cake Mix Yellow $24.40 65LB GILSTER 43269
2/5Lb Carrot Baby Peeled Fresh $22.17 15LB PACKER 56071
30/LBS Carrot Sl Fulk Fz $15.22 120 LB WEST CRK 1993270
6/#10 Carrot Sliced Smooth Med Fancy $22.71 6#10 WESTCRK 863495
15/Lbs Catfish Fil 3-5 Oz Split Fz N/Sushi $77.06 115LB EM TREAS |78894
8/5 b Cereal - Quick Gnits $21.63 85LB QUAKER 978669
4/350z Cereal Crisp Rice $14.62 4350Z HOSPTLTY [76242
4/350z Cereal Fruit Whirls $26.75 4350Z MALTOML [69197
4/350z Cereal Hny Nut Tstd Oat $43.29 43907 GENMILL {52463
4/350z Cereal Sugar Fst Flakes $14.62 4350Z HOSPTLTY [76248
4/5Lb Cheese Am Clrd 120 SI Ezp Ref $43.02 45LB WESTCRK (158718
6/5Lb Cheese American Loaf Ref $64.73 65LB ULTIMELT |[231511
4/5Lb Cheese Chd Mild Clrd Shd Fcy Ref $47.70 45LB WESTCRK [875192
1/51B Cheese Chdr Imit Fthr $11.23 15LB PIANCONE [247736
4/5Lb Cheese Mozz Shd Fthr Lmps Ref $45.56 45LB SLVRSRC 875191
1/5LB Cheese Parm Shd Fcy Bag Ref $18.08 15LB ROMA 296033

Cheese Sauce - Mild Cheddar-large $36.56 6 #10 SLVR SRC 869292
1CS Chick Brst Nug H/Sty Fc $21.37 250 .64 OZ ADVANCE 886812
2/5Lb Chick Brst Strp Frir Rtc Dbbrd H/Sty Avg $26.74 25LB SLVR SRC 238248
1CS Chick Nug Brst Brd Fc Sub NO BID
12-1# Chicken Base Soup $24.74 121 LB SLVRSRC |327888
2/518B Chicken Breast Patty Brd $19.57 25LB TYSON 268286
12-4950z Chicken Noodle $39.57 1250 OZ WEST CRK |265741
6/#10 Chili Con Carne W/O Bean $95.41 6#10 CHEFMATE {52659
180z Chili Powder Light $8.76 1180Z MCCRMCK (863025
25/Lbs Chip Choc Semisweet 4M Per Pound $62.63 125LB HERSHEYS (61125
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Size Prod Description PRICE Pack/Size/Brand PFG Item

id Number
15/160z Chip Corn $14.25 81 LB FRITOS 67408
104/1 OZ Chip Corn Regular ztf $30.99 1041 OZ FRITOS 931053
80/10z Chip Potato Bbq $30.99 1041 0Z LAYS 53888
80/10z Chip Potato Plain $30.99 1041 0Z LAYS 39879
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Food Bid Sheet
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**Electromc -|Ie C' n Be Sent For Tvnm Pu[nosgﬁJLReaue ted
Size Prod Description PRICE
Id
12/12 OZ Chip Potato Plain $13.25 616 0Z LAYS 32479
12/120z Chip Potato Ripple Ztf $18.44 8 16 OZ RUFFLES 241349
80/10z Chip Potato S/Crm & Onn $30.99 1041 0Z LAYS 39888
6/2Lb Chip Tortilla Corn Yel Rnd Stne Gr $29.68 62 LB MISSION 74691
64/1 75 Chip Tortilla'Nacho Chse Ztf $27.50 64 1.75 OZ DORITOS 229989
10Z ~ " |Chives Freeze Dried Chpd $27.84 16.4 0Z MCCRMCK [997464
12/12 OZ Chocolate Chip Semi-Sweet NO BID N/A
1/1 LB Cilantro Wash & Trim $4.09 11 LB PEAK 855550
150z Cinnamon Ground Korintje $4.30 118 OZ SPICE CL 877577
5/Lbs Cocoa 10-12% Butter Fat $25.32 1 5LB DMNDCRY [248059
5/2Lb Coconut Snowflake Swin $27.20 1 10LB POC 69532
Coffee - Regular $48.82 642 (0Z RST XCHG [372142
4/5Lb Coleslaw Dice Color Sep Fresh $14.20 45LB PACKER 862326
6/13.30z Cookie Vanilla Wafer $11.46 6 13.3 OZNABISCO |33635
1CS Corn Bat Nug Sweet Fz $21.66 62LB WESTCRK [339246
96/CNT Corn Cob #3 Sngl/Ser Fz $23.23 196 CT SMPLTCL [28772
24/1Lb Corn Starch Pure $17.58 24 1 LB PRCISION {995112
4-1 GAL Corn Syrup $23.19 41 GA GRDNCLUB |868167
6-144 CT Corn Tortilla $18.82 6144 CT RUDYST 246875
610 Corn Whole Kernel Fancy $26.68 6#10 WEST CRK 863494
20/Lbs Corn Whole Kernel Grd A Igf $17.52 120LB SMPLTCL [27761
20/LBS Corn Yellow Cut Super Swt $16.97 120LB WEST CRK 1993261
1CS Cornbread Mix $22.75 65LB MORRISON [941428
6/5Lb Cornbread Mix Yellow $22.75 65LB MORRISON [941428
25/Lbs Cornmeal Yellow $9.89 125LB SHAWNEE [955186
200/2Cnt Cracker Graham Honey $21.15 2002 CT HONEY 52554
MD
500/2Cnt Cracker Saltine Krispy Zif $14.22 5002 CT HRTG OVN|[271119
10/3Lb Cream Cheese Loaf Ref $55.03 103 LB SCHREIBR [909133
12-50 75 Oz Cream of Chicken $43.84 12 50 OZ WEST CRK 265729
12-49-5 OZ Cream of Mushroom $42.54 12 50 OZ WEST CRK 265740
12-50 OZ Cream of Potato $15.43 1250Z MCCRMCK ]986468
290z Cream Of Tartar $15.43 1250Z MCCRMCK ]986468
12 37/LB Crispito Chicken Cheese $43.16 72 2.75 OZ TYSON 128706
150z Cumin Seed Ground $9.47 114 0Z MCCRMCK [242839
507 Dill Weed $10.94 150Z MCCRMCK [242841
216/2 2 Dough Biscuit Sthrn H/Sty Rnd Handi Spht Fz $36.88 216 2.2 OZ RICHS 256765
16/Lbs Dough Cky Chochip W/ Cndy Pr/P Bs Avg $22.71 1324 CT HRTG OVN [271139
18/3 20z Dressing - Ranch (100 ct) $18.34 18 3.2 OZ FOOTHILL 39857
200/12 Gm Dressing - Salad PC Poly Pouch $17.26 200 .437 OZ MRCL 151048
WHP
100/1.5 Dressing Buttermilk Ranch F/F $19.67 100 1.5 OZ VILL GDN 998968
1CS Dressing Caesar Creamy $13.43 i1 GA VILLGDN |246910
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Size Prod Description PRICE Pack/Size/Brand PFG Item
id Number
4/1Gal Dressing Coleslaw (Mayo) $47.81 41GA KRAFT 68246
4/1 GAL Dressing ltallian Lite $33.71 41GA WISHBONE ]954909
4/1Gal Dressing Miracle Whip $21.98 41GA SLVRSRC 201324
500/12G Dressing Ranch Buttermilk Pkt Poly $13.20 20012 GM WEST 194604
CRK
18/32 0z Dressing Ranch Dry Mix $18.34 18 3.2 0Z FOOTHILL 39857
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Size Prod Description PRICE Pack/Size/Brand PFG item

Id Number
Food Bid Sheet
|October 1. 2015 to March 31. 201
Must use Excel Spreadsheet (Tvped
**Electronic
Size Prod Description PRICE
id
4/1Gal Dressing-Lite Italian,Caesar, Thousand Island NO BID N/A
12/240z Drink Cherry Pwd Mix W/Vitamin C Yield $22.68 1218 OZ WEST CRK [326245
1224 OZ Drnink Grape Pwd Mix $22.68 12 18 OZ WEST CRK |326247
12/24 OZ Drink Lemonade Pwd Mix $22.68 12 18 OZ WEST CRK 326251
12/24 OZ Drink Orange Pwd Mox $22.68 1218 OZ WEST CRK (326252
12124 oz Drink Peach Pwd Mix $22.68 12 18 OZ WEST CRK 326246
12/24 OZ Drink Strawberry Pwd Mix $22.68 1218 OZ WEST CRK {355450
30/12Cnt Egg Shi On XIg Grade A Ref $94.05 301 DZ WEST CRK [891494
90/CNT Enchilada Beef 1 750z $23.58 90 1.750Z 283915
FERNANDO
1/Gal Extract Vanilla Imit $4.22 11 GA BIGCHIEF 1248817
1/Cnt Film Plst 18X2000 Roll Foodservice $16.77 1 2000 FT SLVR SRC ]899594
110 1b Fish Brd Finger 1 oz flo $32.66 160 1 OZ VIKING 437067
50/Lbs Flour H&R $12.90 150 LB BAKERITE {954620
1/Cnt Foil Alum Hvydty 18X1000' Roll $48.88 11000 FT FRST MRK  |157548
1/Cnt Foil Aium Hvydty 18X500' Roll $21.00 1500 FT SLVR SRC 240294
6/170z Food Release Grili/Saute Spray Ztf $19.52 617 0Z WEST CRK [898860
10/LBS Frank All Beef 6" 8-1 $35.82 25LB WESTCRK 157492
1CS Frank All Mt 6" 8-1 Sknls $34.68 25LB BRYAN 996827
610 Fruit Cocktail in Juice Choice $43.07 6#10 WEST CRK 863467
6/#10 Fruit Mixed In Juice $41.14 6 #10 WEST CRK 375132
1CS Fry KK 3/8" Reg Fcy Grd A Fz $22.07 6 5LB GLDNFRY 880605
210z Garlic Powder $18.05 15.25LB SPICECL  |982258
12/240z Gelatin Asst Citrus $27.36 1224 OZ WEST CRK [326238
1CS Gelatin Cherry Mix $26.74 1224 OZ WEST CRK 326268
1CS Gelatin Lime Mix $26.74 1224 OZ WEST CRK 326270
1CS Gelatin Orange Mix $26.74 1224 OZ WEST CRK (326271
1CS Gelatin Strawberry Mix $26.74 1224 OZ WEST CRK [326272
160z Ginger Ground $4.99 11LB SPICECL 429786
6/13 oz Gravy Mix - Brown Light $12.96 6 14 OZ SHWNEEML (863118
6/1.5 Gravy Mix - White Pepper (Country Style) $16.45 6 1.5 LB MORRISON [963095
12/240z Gnits Quick $20.13 1224 OZ QUAKER ]985947
8/5 LB Grits Quick White $20.34 1224 OZ QUAKER 1985947
1CS Ham & Water Bfft Ovl Smkd $2.84 2 10#AV_SLVR SRC 1883832
2/12Up Ham & Water Prod Buffet Hrdwd Smkd Xin $2.84 2 10-12LB WRIGHTS 864588




VoL JPAGE /24
Size Prod Description PRICE Pack/Size/Brand PFG ltem
id Number
4/11 LB Ham & Water Prod Chpd Ckd Weighing 43 90 Ibs  |$24.97 18LB HORMEL 248378
4/251B Ham Smkd Ckd W/A Shngl S| 67 oz Ref $45.63 42.5LB WESTCRK (211670
1/101b Ham-Lunch Meat $45.16 42.51LB WESTCRK |211670
5/38 oz Hash brown-dehydrated 6/2.5 |b $41.56 62.125 # WEST CRK  }439592
4/51b Honey Clover 100% Pure $165.00 41 GA GROEBFRM ]963106
1/10 Ib Hot Link - 5/1 $35.43 111 LB HILLSHIR 923328
2460z Hot Sauce $14.30 246 OZ CAJUNCHF 986977
2/5Lb Hushpuppy Butrmlk Reg Avg 280/Cnt O/R Fz $16.84 25LB DELTAPRD |54601
4/1 Gal Jalapeno Peppers - whole $24.63 41 GA CAJUNCHF (74942
400/ 50z Jelly Asst #1 Pc Cup 160 Grp,160 App,80 $18.54 400 10 GM WEST 194593
CRK
6/#10 Jelly Grape $27.20 641LB WESTCRK [378972
96/4 OZ Juice Apple 100% Cup $13.23 964 0Z ARDMORE (974897
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Food Bid Sheet
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**EIectromc lle C n Be Sent For Tvmnu Purnoses if Reaue ted
Size Prod Description PRICE
Id
72/40z Juice Apple 100% Econo Pk Fz $7.90 704 0Z SUNCUP 969676
72/40z Juice Grape 100% Econo Pack Fz $9.46 724 0Z SUNCUP 330671
1CS Juice Grape 100% Fz $11.89 704 OZ ARDMORE [353248
4/1Gal Juice Lemon 100% Plst Bottle $30.67 41 GA RUBYKIST [158186
96/4 OZ Juice Orange 100% Cup Fsub $15.63 964 0OZ ARDMORE {976002
72/40z Juice Orange 100% Econo Pack Fz $9.52 704 OZ SUNCUP 969677
6/#10 Ketchup Fancy 33% (Z) $20.82 6 #10 WEST CRK 878195
1000/9G Ketchup Fancy Pc Pkt Foil $16.78 10009 GM  WEST 194580
CRK
28 oz Lemon Pepper $11.24 128 OZ MCCRMCK }242862
1CS Lettuce Iceberg Head Prem $31.58 124 CT PEAK 907437
24/Cnt Lettuce Iceberg Prem Liner Fresh High/Low $32.62 46 CT PACKER 975303
12-1# Light Brown Sugar $24.49 122 LB DIXIECR 862506
1-35# Liquid Shortening $18.40 135LB SLVR SRC 897414
30/1Lb Margarine Solid Ref $14.54 301 LB WESTCRK [157451
12-1# Marshmallow $13.19 121 LB HOSPTLTY |993373
1CS Mayonnaise White Pc Pkt $29.52 500 12 GM WEST 194583
CRK
24/140z Milk Condensed Sweetened $45.65 24 14 OZ LALECHER [919971
48/120z Milk Evaporated Tall Can $20.68 24 12 0Z VELVET 359541
25/18 OZ Milk Skim Choc Carton Ref $6.35 258 0Z COLEMANS |276133
25/80z Milk Whole 3 25% White Carton Ref $6.45 25 5PT COLEMANS 1951401
6/1 GAL Milk Whole White Plst Ref $22.14 61 GA COLEMANS (918679
6/24 OZ Mix Gravy Country Pepper $21.62 624 OZ WEST CRK 438986
6-#10 Mixed Veg $30.73 6 #10 WEST CRK 863483
6/#10 Mushroom Stems & Pieces Net Drained Wt $46.38 6#10 LUIGI 231805
500/CNT Mustard 2 0z Pc $9.15 500 5.5 GM WEST 194581
CRK
4/1Gal Mustard Salad Yellow Prepared $14.85 41 GA WESTCRK }234877
160z Nutmeg Ground $9.39 11LB SPICECL 914797
1cs Oatmeal Old Fashioned $33.96 1242 0Z QUAKER 43293
12/420z2 Oatmeal Quick $33.98 1242 OZ QUAKER 43285
4/5Lb Okra Brd Hvy Iqgf $20.49 45LB STILWELL |41886
6/24 OZ Onion French Fried $33.46 624 OZ WEST CRK 1334993
1-20 oz Onion Powder $4.37 120 0Z SPICE CL 982586
6/25L8 Onion Ring Bat Beer 5/8 $35.78 62.5 LB WEST CRK [998673
50/Lbs Onion Yellow Jumbo #2 Bag Fresh $22.15 150 LB PEAK 898641
1CS Onion Yellow Med NO BID N/A
25/LBS Onion Yellow Med 2-3.5" $16.17 150 LB PACKER 977847
138/Cnt Orange Navel Fancy Ref $25.00 1 113 CT PACKER 891784
120z Oregano Ground $10.80 113 0Z MCCRMCK (936047
6/17 oz Pan Spray $16.55 6170Z CRYSTLS [931353
6/5Lb Pancake Buttermilk Mix Awo $19.73 65LB HOSPTLTY |[882914
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160z Paprika Ground $50.61 6 18 OZ MCCRMCK 1242686
110z Parsley Flakes $12.45 1100Z MCCRMCK [56551
12/1Lb Pasta Lasagna 10" Ribbed Ripple Edge $15.71 121 LB ASSOLUTI [251641
20/Lbs Pasta Macaroni Elbow Thk Wall $29.67 310LB ASSOLUTI [251734
6/#10 Pea Blackeye Fcy $26.13 6 #10 ALLENS 40354
6/#10 Pea Green 3 Sieve X Std $34.70 6#10 WESTCRK  [863492
6/#10 Pea Purple Hull $25.47 6 #10 ALLENS 149782
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Size Prod Description PRICE Pack/Size/Brand PFG Item
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Food Bid Sheet
October 1. 2015 to March 31, 201
Mu se Excel Spreadshee _ Jation**
**Electronic File C ted
Size Prod Description PRICE
Id
20/LBS Pea Purple Hull Fz $20.18 120 LB ALLENS 960992
6/#10 Peach Diced in Light Syrup $33.72 6#10 PACKER 984060
6/#10 Peach Sliced Irregular - Has Been Replaced $31.97 6#10 MAGELLAN [267816
6/5Lb Peanut Butter Creamy $41.81 65LB WESTCRK 308156
6/#10 Pear Diced I/ Lt Syrup Choice $40.90 6#10 WESTCRK  [375145
6#10 Peas, black eyes 6/10 $25.57 6#10 ALLENS 40354
1/20lb Peas, black eyes dried $25.47 120 LB SLVR SRC 390428
5/Lbs Pecan Pieces Med Fancy Ref $41.54 15LB MAGELLAN (357221
5/LBS Pecan Pieces Sm Fancy Ref $39.20 15LB ELLISP 248064
6#10 Peeled Tomato $16.85 6#10 ASSOLUTI 231901
6/#10 Pep Jalp Whi Field Run $18.00 6 #10 DEL SOL 876764
122 1B Pepper Bell Diced Green $15.70 15LB QUALITY 74376
5/Lbs Pepper Black Cafe Grind 20 Mesh $43.74 15LB ROMA 264697
16/0z Pepper Cayenne Ground Red $3.60 114 OZ SPICE CL 468855
2/5Lb Pepper Green Diced 1/4" Ref $15.37 15LB QUALITY 74376
4/1 GAL Pepper Jalapeno Hot Cajun $24.89 41 GA CAJUNCHF (74942
6/#10 Pepper Jalapeno Sliced $20.03 6 #10 DEL SOL 910561
4/1 GAL Pepper Jalapeno Sliced $21.73 41 GA ROMA 128341
6000/.1G Pepper Pc Pkt Poly $21.72 6000.1 GM WEST  [905282
CRK
4/138 oz Picante Sauce, mild $33.59 4 138 OZ MESAGRND {83597
5/Gal Pickle Dill 1/8" SI Kk Avg 2970 Cnt $16.34 1 5GA CHF SUPR 279600
4/1Gal Pickle Dill Kosher Spear $25.93 41GA WESTCRK [313907
20/80z Pie Shell Lard Shrtng 10" Unbkd Fz $24.00 20 10 IN HRTG OVN {199360
6/#10 Pineapple Tidbit I/ Jc Import $27.93 6#10 PACKER 956793
128/Cnt Pizza Brkfst Sausage 3X4 50/50 Fz $46.90 128 3.31 OZ TONYS |311244
96/4 57 Pizza Peprn 4X6 Smart Piz Fz $49.24 96 4.48 OZ TONYS 869644
96/4 78 Pizza Sausage 4X6 Smart Pizza Fz $46.89 96 4.56 OZ THE MAX 373576
118" Plastic Food Wrap 18 X 2000 $20.14 1 2000 FT FRST MRK 157555
10/Lbs Pollock Brd O/R Stick Ak 1 Oz Igf $33.00 160 1 OZ VIKING 437067
2/5Lb Pollock Brd Rect 4 Oz O/R Ak Fz Seacnisp $29.95 25LB SAMBAND [962048
10/Lbs Pork Chop Bn/In Cc Avg 40/4 Oz Bulk 1412A $30.38 110 LB WEST CRK [416631
40/40z Pork Pty Brd Chpd Frmd W/ Prk Trmg Fc Avg $31.72 404 OZ SPRCRSPY |878164
10/Lbs Pork Pty Frir Chpd & Frmd Avg 40/4 Oz Raw $31.72 404 OZ SPRCRSPY (878164
10/Lbs Pork Pty Rib Bbg Fc Avg 46/3 5 Oz Super $49.13 80 2.25 OZ RIBBQ 174072
6/5 Ib Potato - French fries (straight cut) $19.38 65LB SLVR SRC 197480
50/Lbs Potato 50 Cntavg Idh Rus Burbk Us#1 Carton $20.54 150LB PEAK 255147
6/2 25Lb Potato Hshbrn Shred Dehy $42.00 62.125 # WEST CRK  [439592
610 Potato Mashed Complete Granules W/Vit C $40.35 6 #10 TRURECIP 864225
6/3 24LB Potato Mashed Real Dehy $52.65 1226 OZ WEST CRK (439576
40/LBS Potato Sweet 40 Cnt Avg $14.13 140 LB PACKER 16669
6/5Lb Potato Tater Barrels Bakeable Fz $26.57 65LB WESTCRK [197438
1CS Potato White Whole $31.60 6#10 ALLENS 89005
6/5 b Potato-French fries (crinkle cut) $22.07 6 5LB GLDNFRY 880605
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24-1# Powdered Sugar $24.00 122LB DIXIECR 336275
6410 Pudding Banana Rtu $26.48 6#10 SLVR SRC 869302
6/#10 Pudding Chocolate Rtu $26.38 6 #10 SLVR SRC 869305
6/#10 Pudding Vanilla Rtu $27.11 6#10 SLVR SRC 869306
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Size

Prod Description PRICE Pack/Size/Brand PFG item
id Number
Food Bid Sheet
[October 1. 2015 to March 31, 2016
X n in "all” i ion**
**Electronic File Qﬁﬂ.&e_s_enl_lio_l'_'l'_\tp_in_q_&um_o_s_e_ﬂf Reaquested
Size Prod Description PRICE
Id
200/9G Relish Sweet Pc Pkt $24.17 5009 GM WEST 194586
CRK
4/1Gal Relish Swt Std Plst $23.60 41GA WESTCRK [313896
25/Lbs Rice Long Grain White $8.80 125LB WEST CRK |194608
60z Sage Rubbed Ground $9.71 160Z MCCRMCK |56528
24/14 75 Salmon Pink Trad Style $81.78 6 64 OZ CHICOSEA |48676
4/1Gal Saisa Thick/Chunky Mild $39.89 41GA WEST CRK |303563
370z Salt Garlic $40.53 112LB MCCRMCK [981687
12/110z Salt Garlic Seasoning $71.94 622 0Z LAWRYS 263441
6000/ 6G Salt lodized Pc Pkt Poly $8.83 6000 .5 GM WEST 905283
CRK
25/Lbs Salt Plain Bulk $6.05 125LB WEST CRK ]334001
1-5# Salt Seasoning N/Msg $16.71 15LB LAWRYS 931953
4/1Gal Sauce Bbq $33.14 41GA WESTCRK {234869
4/1Gal Sauce Bbgq Smokey Bold $33.50 41 GA WESTCRK |234869
6/#10 Sauce Cheese Chd Aged Rtu $36.16 6#10 SLVR SRC 869291
6410 Sauce Cheese Mild Chd Rtu $36.16 6#10 SLVR SRC 869292
24/60z Sauce Hot Louisiana $16.24 24 6 OZ LOUISIAN [150347
610 Sauce Marinara Chunky $27.52 6#10 ROMA 240392
24/20z Sauce Pepper $15.88 126 OZ LOUISIAN [978291
4/1 GAL Sauce Picante Mild $41.57 4 138 OZ PACE 997073
4/1 GAL Sauce Soy $16.99 41GA PACKER 948503
12/5 0Z Sauce Tabasco Red $34.23 1250Z TABASCO {42228
500/9G Sauce Taco PcPkt Poly $15.68 5009 GM  WEST 194596
CRK
500/12G Sauce Tarter Pc Pkt Poly $30.65 500 12 GM  WEST 194599
CRK
1CS Sausage Lnk 4-1 Smkd $29.68 110LB TASTYBND (426669
50/3 20z Sausage Lnk Hot Red 5-1 Fz $26.63 25LB PETITIN 434417
2/5Lb Sausage Prk Ls Bulk Fz $25.00 110LB SO QLTY 955111
96/2 OZ Sausage Prk Pty 2 oz $24.13 112LB WEST CRK [211448
11/Lbs Sausage Smkd Rope Fz $24.24 111 LB HILLSHIR 926037
1CS Sausage Smkd S| Bias Ref NO BID
1CS Sausage Smoked Sl Bias NO BID
12/80z Seasoning Creole Orig $16.98 128 0Z TONY CHA [859455
13 0Z Seasoning File Gumbo NO BID N/A
220z Seasoning Lemon Pep Sf N/Msg $11.49 128 OZ MCCRMCK [242862
12/1Qt Seasoning Liquid Smoke $11.33 11 GA WESTCRK }243371
8/25Cnt Shell Taco 5" Reg Yel $11.39 200 .38 OZ MISSION 1969463
1-50# Shortening - all purpose $28.64 150 LB WEST CRK |[897338
1/25 b Shortening - Clear Fry Liquid NO BID N/A
1CS Shortening Fry Meat & Veg $29.58 1 50 LB WEST CRK 897338
35/LBS Shortening Frying Lg Cir Soybean ZTF $18.99 1351L.B SLVRSRC |897414
Pkgs Sloppy Joe Mix $23.93 615 0Z LAWRYS 968149
12/50. Soup - Cream of Chicken - Condensed or large $45.27 12 50 OZ WEST CRK [265729
1211b Soup Base - Chicken flavored - granular 12/1# $24.21 121 LB SLVRSRC |327888
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12/49 5 oz Soup Chicken Noodle Condensed Can $38.72 12 50 OZ WEST CRK (265741
12/49 25 Soup Cream of Celery $39.57 12 50 OZ WEST CRK 265742
1CS Soup Cream of Chicken/Msg Cond Can NO BID N/A
1CS Soup Cream of Mushroom N/Msg Cond Can $42.99 12 50 OZ WEST CRK [265740
12/49 5 oz Soup Cream of Mushroom-condensed or large NO BID N/A
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Size Prod Description PRICE
id
12/50 oz Soup Cream of Potato $27.90 34LB CAMPBLLS [88123
12/1 b Soup Mix - Beef flavored - granular 12/1# $27.55 121 LB SLVR SRC 327920
12/51 oz Soup Tomato N/Msg Cond Can $34.37 1250 OZ WEST CRK (265738
100-1 OZ Sour Cream Pkg $10.56 1001 OZ WEST CRK {245494
1-20# Spaghetti $15.87 210 LB LUIGI 256747
6-#10 Spaghetti Sauce $21.52 6#10 WEST CRK ]878199
4/5 1B Squash Brd Yel Si Dfo $23.38 451.B WESTCRK [995204
6-5# Sugar $27.47 150 LB WEST CRK |324896
1-50# Sugar - Light Brown NO BID 874565
1 1b box Sugar - White Powered $35.43 150LB WESTCRK [268808
1 1b box Syrup - Corn Light/White $22.93 41GA GRDNCLUB |868167
4/1 Gal Syrup Cups $11.21 100 1.5 0Z WEST 352932
CRK
1001 OZ Syrup Pancake & Waffle - TX $21.99 200 1.5 OZ WEST 194587
CRK
100/1 oz Syrup Pancake & Waffle - TX $23.29 41GA WESTCRK 337562
4/1 GAL Taco Sauce $15.85 5009 GM WEST 194596
CRK
200-9 GRAM Taco Seasonong $20.93 690Z LAWRYS 77828
6-11 OZ Tea Bags $12.26 96 1 0Z GUEST HS [907377
96-1 OZ Tea Filter Pack $21.69 32 3.5 0Z SLVR SRC ]907342
1CS Tea Iced Pouch Plain $12.26 96 1 0Z GUESTHS [907377
96/1 0Z Tomato Paste $32.03 6 #10 WEST CRK 878197
6410 Tomato Rnd Red #2 Fresh $16.08 125LB PACKER 954795
1CS Tomato Round Café' Culls NO BID N/A
1/25 LB Tomato Sauce $18.45 6#10 WESTCRK |878209
6#10 Tomato Soup $34.37 1250 0Z WEST CRK J265738
12-51 02 Tomatoes- peeled whole in tomato juice-US Grade [$17.29 6#10 SLVR SRC 878220
B
6/#10 Tomatoes w/Green Chilies - Rotel $26.04 1228 OZ ROTEL 92877
12/28 oz Tortilla FIr White 8% $33.64 24 1 DZ MISSION 969517
24/12 CNT Tortillas - Corn $18.01 6 144 CT RUDYST 246845
6/144 ct Tortillas - Flour (24 doz) 8" $34.37 24 1 DZ MISSION 969517
24/12 ct Tuna $96.71 6 66.5 OZ CHICOSEA (33581
6-66 6 OZ Turkey Breast $3.46 2 10#AV RDGCRST |891756
2-10# AV Turkey Breast, Smoked $2.90 2 9#AV SLVR SRC [890828
2/8-10# Turkey Corn Dog $32.26 484 OQZ STATEFR 947908
48-4 OZ Turkey lunch meat $60.16 425LB WESTCRK |211773
4-2 5# Turnip Green Chpd Ls $21.52 6#10 ALLENS 39066
6H#10 Vanilla Extract $4.13 1 1 GA BIGCHIEF  [|248817
1 gallon Vanilla Wafers $11.33 6 13.3 OZ NABISCO  [33635
6-133 OZ Vegetable Bind Calif Grd A Broc Cflr CR 1QF $22.63 122 LB WEST CRK [433756
1cs Vegetable Bnd oriental fry $25.25 122LB WEST CRK 283449
30/Lbs Vegetables-mixed $18.07 120 LB WEST CRK [993227
4-1 GAL Vinegar $9.48 41GA WESTCRK [273740
4/1 GAL Vinegar Cider Flavored Out $14.80 41GA WESTCRK (273719
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18/8 Waffle Jumbo 1 3 0z Sq Fz $16.14 144 127 OZ 58922
MRSBTRWR
144 CT Waffle Stick $22.61 1 144 CT BEL CHEF }66430
110 b Weiners - all meat $13.45 110 LB FARMLAND 24277
4-1 GAL Worcestershire $15.55 41 GA CAJUNCHF [941091
75-310z Wrap Breakfast $48.36 90 3.50 OZ 373436
FERNANDO
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Food Bid Sheet
October 1, 2015 to March 31, 2016
Must use Excel Spreadsheet (Typed) and fiil in "all" information**
“*Electronic File Can Be Sent For Typing Purposes if Requested
Size Prod Description PRICE
Id
6410 Yams Cut $29.70 6 #10 PRINCELL 116561
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Dale LaGrone, Pct #4

September 14, 2015

Ms. Kari Beaver

Flowers Baking Co. of Tyler, LLC
1200 West Erwin

Tyler, Texas 75702

NOTIFICATION OF BID AWARD

This is to notify you that your firm has been awarded a contract by the Panola
County Commissioners’ Court on September 14, 2015. The contract is for a period
beginning October 1, 2015 and ending March 31, 2016.

You have been awarded the bid for the following item(s) and/or service(s):
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS/SERVICES BID PRICE
Bread (White Sandwich Bread,

Wheat Sandwich Bread, Hamburger Buns,

Hot Dog Buns, Honey Wheat Bread, 4 2"

Bulk SD, Dinner Roll, 4" Bulk Plain,
Sliced Rolls, Jumbo 4.5" Buns) As Bid

4%% Ry

COUNTY JUDGE  {J

September 14, 2015
DATE
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PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE
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. ERIA, |
Office: 903.693.0333 /?‘:MP 314 W. Wellington ;
Fax: 903.693.9366 . ’ Carthage, Texas 75633
Nx) /
Coum‘*
Sheriff Kevin Lake
August 18, 2015
Flowers
Attn: Kari Beaver
1200 W. Erwin

Tyler, Tx 75702
Attention: Ms. Beaver

Re: Bids for Food ltems

The Panola County Detention Center is taking bids for food items. The attached contains food items that would be
purchased during the next six months. Please note that the form is somewhat different. It is requested by the auditor’s
office that the item number, package size and type of good be listed and the bid list. | would appreciate a bid on any and |
all items/products that you sell. If you do not sell any of the items listed, please fill in “not applicable” in the cost
column. All entries must be typed; electrenic format is available upon request.

If you do not wish to submit a bid, please fax this letter back “No Bid Submitted” and your signature.

The items bid selected for purchase will be for a six month period, beginning October 1, 2015 through March 31, 2016. ,
It is understood that fresh produce, fresh meat products and fresh cheeses can only be predicted on a weekly basis. ‘

The Panola County Commissioners Court request | have the bids in hand by September 4, 2015. You may return by mail,
email or hand deliver. Thank you in advance for your time and consideration.

Lt. Tina C. McMullen, Jail Administrator
Panola County Detention Center
tina.memullen@co.panola.tx.us

COMPANY NAME Flowers Baking Co of Tyler, LLC

NO BID SUBMITTED

BID SUBMITTED/SEE ATTACHED. 4

Honesty, Integrity, Service



PANOLA COUNTY JAIL
FOOD ITEMS BID SHEET
OCTOBER 1, 2015 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2016

ITEM NUMBERS AND PRICES MUST BE LISTED

ITEM # BRAND PKG.SIZE DESCRIPTION PRICE
100-1927-0 Flowers |BREAD 202§ oz  |White Sandwich Bread $1.62 per loaf |
100-1928-0 Flowers | BREAD 20 3¢ oz  |Wheat Sandwich Bread $1.75 per loaf
101-2376-0 SunbeartlBREAD 8 ct. Hamburger Buns $1.49 per pkg
101-2388-0 SunbeaBREAD 8 ct. Hot Dog Buns $1.49 per pkg
102-1508-0 Nature's|BREAD 2¢ oz {Honey Wheat Bread $1.95 per loaf
100-2556-0 Flowers |BREAD 4 1/2 Bulk SD $4.10 per pkg
511-3129-0 Wonder {BREAD 12 ct.  {Won Karex DNR ROwhite Dnr Roll $1.49 peLp_ka
100-2670-0 Flowers |BREAD 30 ct. 4" Bulk Plain $4.29 per pkg
[100-2912-0 Flowers |BREAD 24 ct. Krgstz! Rolls Sliced Rolis $2.54 per pka
101-2536-0 SunbearfBREAD 8 ct. Mrjsutx Jumbo 4 1/2" Hamburger Buns $1.99 per pka ,

Flowers Baking Co of Tyler, LLC

1200 West Erwin Street

Tyler, Tx 75702

903-595-2421 phone

903-535-7976 fax

August 28, 2015
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V- County Judge

CO unty Of PanOla " Lee Ann Jones

110 S. Sycamore * Room 216-A oy Commissioners
Carthage » Texas 75633 John Gradberg, Pct #2

Phone 903-693-0391 » Fax 903-693-2726 e e e, b 2

September 14, 2015

Mr. Mitch Mahan

Tyson Foods, Inc.

1484 NE Loop 436
Carthage, Texas 75633

NOTIFICATION OF BID AWARD

This is to notify you that your firm has been awarded a contract by the Panola
County Commissioners’ Court on September 14, 2015. The contract is for a period
beginning October 1, 2015 and March 31, 2016.

You have been awarded the bid for the following item(s) and/or service(s):
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS/SERVICES BID PRICE

Chicken:
Case Leg Quarters
Case Miscuts
Case Legs & Thighs
Case Breast-bone in
Case Breast-boneless
Whole Chicken 40 Ib. frozen
Whole Chicken fresh or frozen 70 Ib. As Bid

EAY/ DO

COUNTY JUDGE

September 14, 2015
DATE
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PANOLA COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE
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. EHER!
Office: 903 693 0333 JS“ F&\ﬂ 314 W, Wellington

PRNOLY

Fax 903.693.9366 Carthage, Texas 75633

Sheriff Kevin Lake

August 18, 2015

eon MAD M

Attn: Ja Ritter
1484 NE Loop
Carthage, Tx 75633

Attention: W

Re: Bids for Food Items

The Panola County Detention Center is taking bids for food items. The attached contains food items that would be
purchased during the next six months. Please note that the form is somewhat different. 1t is requested by the auditor’s
office that the item number, package size and type of good be listed and the bid list. | would appreciate a bid on any and
all items/products that you sell. If you do not sell any of the items listed, please fill in “not applicable” in the cost
column. All entries must be typed; electronic format is avzilable upon request.

if you do not wish to submit a bid, please fax this letter back “No Bid Submitted” and your signature.

The items bid selected for purchase will be for a six month period, beginning October 1, 2015 through March 31, 2016.
It is understood that fresh produce, fresh meat products and fresh cheeses can only be predicted on a weekly basis.

The Pancla County Commissioners Court request | have the bids in hand by September 4, 2015. You may return by mail,
email or hand deliver. Thank you in advance for your time and consideration.

Lt. Tina C. MicMullen, Jail Administrator

Panola County Detention Center
tina.mcmullen@co.panola.tx.us

-
COMPANY NAMETyﬂVl FDM{J ) Wy

NO BID SUBMITTED

BID SUBMITTED/SEE ATTACHF?Q W%‘/

Honesty, Integrity, Service
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PANOLA COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

CHICKEN ITEMS BID SHEET

OCTOBER 1, 2015 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2016

ALL COLUMNS "MUST" BE COMPLETED

ITEM # PKG. SIZE Description PRICE
CASE BREAST BONE IN
CASE BREAST BONELESS
023618-0928 33LBS CASE LEG QUARTERS 18.00
CASE LEGS & THIGHS
038262-0001 40 LBS CASE MISCUTS 18 00
038262-0001 40 LBS WHOLE CHICKEN 40 LB FROZEN 18.00

WHOLE CHICKEN FRESH OR FROZEN 70 LB




	16 Food Bids

